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FOI Response 

Information provided under the Freedom of Information Act 
 

Title of Request: Freedom of Information Request  
 
FOI Reference: FOI/OPCC/21-031 
 

 

Date of Request: 14/11/2021 
  

Date of Response/Release: 19/11/2021 

Information Requested: Pursuant to the Freedom of Information Act 2000 England, I 
hereby request the following records. 
 
1. Question: The total number of use of force incidents reported by law enforcement, 

separated by year and by type of force used from 2013-2020 (for example: 27 taser 
incidents in 2019, 34 taser incidents in 2020, 6 baton incidents in 2019, 3 baton 
incidents in 2020, etc.) 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

2. Question: The total number of civilian complaints alleging any form of law 
enforcement misconduct that were reported and the total number sustained from 
2013-2020, separated by year (for example: 8 complaints in 2016, 2 complaints 
sustained in 2016, 4 complaints in 2017, 1 complaint sustained in 2017, etc.) 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

3. Question: The total number of civilian complaints alleging law enforcement use of 
excessive force that were reported and the total number sustained from 2013-2020, 
separated by year. 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

4. Question: The total number of civilian complaints alleging biased policing or racial 
profiling that were reported and the total number sustained from 2013-2020, 
separated by year. 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

5. Question: The total number of civilian complaints alleging criminal conduct that were 
reported and the total number sustained from 2013-2020, separated by year. 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
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6. Question: The total number of civilian complaints alleging sexual assault that were 
reported and the total number sustained from 2013-2020, separated by year. 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

7. Question: A list of all officer involved shootings that were directed at a person from 
2013-2020 (excluding shootings of animals and accidental discharges that are not 
directed at a person). 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

8. Question: The total number of unresolved investigations sustained from 2013-2020, 
separated by year. 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

 
However, you may wish to contact Cambridgeshire Constabulary (the “Constabulary”), which 
is a separate organisation to the OPCC and is treated as such under the Act.  You can contact 
the Constabulary by email at foi@cambs.pnn.police.uk 

 
Alternatively, please see the link below to the Constabulary’s Freedom of Information pages:  
https://www.cambs.police.uk/information-and-services/About-us/Freedom-of-
information/Make-an-FOI-request 
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