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FOI Response 

Information provided under the Freedom of Information Act 
 

Title of Request: Freedom of Information Request 
 
FOI Reference: FOI/OPCC/21-029 
 

 

Date of Request: 26/10/2021 
 

Date of Response/Release: 01/11/2021 

Information Requested:  
Under the freedom of information act I would like to know the following information. 
 
1. Question: How many crimes in general have been committed against males and how 

many against females in your area each year for the past 10 years?  
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information.  
 

2. Question: How many males and how many females have been 
murdered/manslaughtered in your area each year for the past 10 years?  
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

3. Question: How many males and how many females have been assaulted (G.B.H, 
A.B.H etc) in your area each year for the past 10 years?  
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

4. Question: How many males and how many females have reported being raped in 
your area each year for the past 10 years?  
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
 

5. Question: Have you any idea of how many unreported cases of rape there are in your 
area against males and against females each year.  I understand that this may be 
guesswork as it is difficult to accurately depict numbers on unreported crimes.  
Guesswork on this question will be satisfactory.  Again covering the past ten years. 
 

 OPCC Response: The OPCC does not hold this information. 
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However, you may wish to contact Cambridgeshire Constabulary (the “Constabulary”), 
which is a separate organisation to the OPCC and is treated as such under the Act. You can 
contact the Constabulary by email at foi@cambs.pnn.police.uk 
 
Alternatively, please see the link below to the Constabulary’s Freedom of Information pages:  
https://www.cambs.police.uk/information-and-services/About-us/Freedom-of-
information/Make-an-FOI-request 
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