



Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner

PO Box 688

PE29 9LA

Tel: 0300 333 3456

Email: [cambs-pcc@cambs.police.uk](mailto:cambs-pcc@cambs.police.uk)

Twitter: [@PCCCambs](https://twitter.com/PCCCambs)

## FOI Response

### Information provided under the Freedom of Information Act

Freedom of Information Request	
<b>FOI Reference:</b> FOI/OPCC/24-011	
<b>Date of Request:</b> 18/04/2024	<b>Date of Response:</b> 20/05/2024
<b>Information Requested:</b>	
1.	<p><b>Question:</b></p> <p>Spend on Office supplies and associated products for the below financial years:</p> <p>1st April 2022 – 31st March 2023</p> <p>1st April 2023 – 31st March 2024</p>
	<p><b>OPCC Response:</b></p> <p>1st April 2022 – 31st March 2023: £119.10 for Cambridgeshire OPCC</p> <p>1st April 2023 – 31st March 2024: £527.77 for Cambridgeshire OPCC</p>
2.	<p><b>Question:</b></p> <p>Start date &amp; duration of Contract?</p> <p>Is there an extension clause in the contract and, if so, the duration of the extension?</p> <p>Has a decision been made yet on whether the contract is to be either extended or renewed?</p>

	<p>Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for the contract?</p> <p>Name of Incumbent Supplier?</p> <p>How long have you traded with them?</p>
	<p><b>OPCC Response:</b></p> <p>The OPCC does not hold this information.</p>
3.	<p><b>Question:</b></p> <p>If you publish your register of contracts and purchasing, can you please provide a website link.</p>
	<p><b>OPCC Response:</b></p> <p><a href="http://www.cambridgeshire-pcc.gov.uk/what-we-do/money/contracts-and-tenders/">www.cambridgeshire-pcc.gov.uk/what-we-do/money/contracts-and-tenders/</a></p>
4.	<p><b>Question:</b></p> <p>In addition, can you confirm if you have a contract in place for Tail End Spend.</p>
	<p><b>OPCC Response:</b></p> <p>The OPCC does not hold this information.</p>

You may wish to contact Cambridgeshire Constabulary, which is a separate organisation to the OPCC and is treated as such under the Act. Please see the following link to Cambridgeshire Constabulary's Freedom of Information page on their website: [Cambridgeshire Constabulary's FOI Information](#)